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I would like to defend the traditional conservative view that judges should not second-guess political debates in 
the name of amorphous rights that do not appear in the text or history of the Constitution.1 Indeed, that promise 
was precisely what attracted me to the Federalist Society in law school when I was a bipartisan renegade who, 
trying to evade the glances of my professors, would sneak into Federalist Society meetings. I received with relish 
the Federalist claims that liberal justices were short-circuiting all of our most important political debates by 
making up rights that do not appear in the text of the Constitution (like the right to privacy in Griswold v. 
Connecticuty and, as a result, that those justices were not interpreting the law but instead making it. 
 
 
 
I was surprised, therefore, to discover in recent years a libertarian movement that has called into question those 
Federalist Society axioms.3 Some libertarians now argue that Lochner is defensible and that a great number of 
laws and regulations might be struck down in the name of unenumerated rights that have the most tenuous roots 
in the text or history of the Constitution.4 Not all conservatives, however, are sympathetic to this invitation to 
economic judicial activism. There have actually been three separate strains of legal conservatism over the past 
30 years: libertarian conservatives, tea party conservatives, and pro-executive power conservatives.5  
 
 
 
There are significant tensions among these three strands of legal conservatism. When it was founded in the 
1980s, the Federalist Society was initially successful at persuading conservatives to paper over those tensions by 
converging around a common rhetoric of "original understanding" and "judicial restraint."6 But that spirit of unity 
did not last long. As conservatives began to receive appointments to the federal appellate courts during the 
Reagan administration, divisions among the three strands began to emerge.7 
 
 
 
Perhaps the most striking division was the one between libertarians and conservatives who tended to back 
executive power. This conflict was on display in a debate between thenJudge Scalia and Professor Richard 
Epstein.8 It was held at the CATO Institute in 1984.9 Judge Scalia addressed a standingroom-only crowd and 
defended the view that judges should restrain themselves from overturning laws in the name of rights or liberties 
not clearly and expressly enumerated in the Constitution.10 The "reversal of a half-century of judicial restraint in 
the economic realm," he said, "posed a threat to constitutional democracy."11 Judge Scalia argued that 
conservatives who had criticized the Warren Court for liberal judicial activism now faced a "moment of truth": 
They had to show the courage to reject conservative judicial activism in the economic arena as well.12 
 
 
 
When Professor Epstein heard what Judge Scalia had to say, he delivered a spontaneous attack on Scalia's 
position. Freely admitting he was questioning the conservative conventional wisdom, he said judges should be 
much more aggressive in protecting economic liberty.13 There are many blatantly inappropriate statutes that call 
out for a quick and easy kill, he said, citing price controls and other legislative regulation of the economy.14 He 
excoriated the Supreme Court for refusing to strike those laws down.15 
 
 
 
That debate established a clear distinction between proexecutive power conservatives like Justice Scalia, who are 
suspicious of economic judicial activism, and libertarians like Professor Epstein and Professor Randy Barnett, who 
support aggressive enforcement of unenumerated rights, such as the liberty of contract. They both, for example, 
favor striking down the Patient Protection and Affordable Care Act of 2010 (PPACA).16 Their avatar on the 



Supreme Court is not Justice Scalia but Justice Kennedy, who is the libertarian justice most sympathetic to their 
views.17 
 
 
 
Since 1984, a third strand of legal conservatism has developed: tea party conservatism.18 Tea party 
conservatives share with the libertarians a suspicion of broad federal power.19 They part company with the 
libertarian conservatives on social issues, however, and they oppose abortion rights and gay marriage.20 On the 
Supreme Court, the avatar of Tea Party conservatism is Justice Thomas, who is principled in his devotion both to 
social conservatism and to states' rights. 
 
 
 
Remaining true to the Federalist Society tradition of judicial restraint requires following Justice Scalia' s example 
and rejecting the activism of both the libertarian wing and the tea party wing of the conservative legal movement. 
How many federal statutes would have to be struck down if this activist vision were taken seriously? In 2005, I 
wrote an article for the New York Times Magazine that talked about the resurgence of a libertarian movement 
that some associated with the phrase the "Constitution in Exile," which Judge Douglas Ginsburg had used to 
identify legal doctrines that established firm limitations on state and federal power.21 
 
 
 
The movement, critics argued, had no shortage of targets. Cass Sunstein predicted that as the movement 
succeeded, many decisions of the FCC, EPA, OSHA, and possibly SEC and NLRB would be declared 
unconstitutional.22 The Social Security Act would be under constitutional stress.23 Some applications of the 
Endangered Species Act and the Clean Water Act also could be struck down.24 And in an extreme nightmare 
scenario, the right of individuals to freedom of contract would be so vigorously interpreted that minimum-wage 
and maximumhour laws would also be jeopardized.25 
 
 
 
These possibilities for a libertarian movement that questioned the constitutionality of the post-New Deal 
regulatory state were criticized as scaremongering.26 Surely, critics argued, conservative activists would not 
truly press all of these points. But as it turned out, they did. Tea party conservatives now openly question the 
constitutionality of the FCC, the EPA, and, of course, the Federal Reserve.27 
 
 
 
In his book. The Five Thousand Year Leap, the constitutional bible of the Tea Party Movement, W. Cleon Skousen 
posed 101 constitutional questions to federal candidates28 and called for striking down many federal agencies, as 
well as Social Security and the Welfare State.29 Presidential candidates Rick Perry and Michele Bachmann have 
embraced many of the same views. In the courts, federal judges are questioning the Endangered Species Act.30 
There is nothing unprincipled about this position. It is an effort to carry to logical conclusions the principles that 
Professor Barnett, Professor Epstein, and others embrace. But the scope of judicial invalidation and the 
aggressiveness of the use of the courts to short circuit contested economic and political debates can no longer be 
doubted. 
 
 
 
And what about judicial restraint? What about the Federalist Society pledge that courts should strike down laws 
only on the basis of rights that are clearly rooted in the text and history of the Constitution?31 
 
 
 
This requires us to think about Lochner.32 What was the problem of Lochnerism? Why is it that pro-executive 
power conservatives like Chief Justice Roberts and Justices Scalia and Alito view it as the root of all constitutional 
evil?33 There are several ways of stating the problem of Lochnerism, and they are found in different forms in the 
two dissents by Justice Holmes34 and Justice Harlan.35 For Holmes, the problem of Lochnerism was a problem of 
text.36 The Constitution does not speak of freedom of contract, as the Court later echoed in West Coast Hotel Co. 
v. Parrish,37 and judges should not strike down laws on the basis of unenumerated rights because that makes 
them democratically vulnerable.38 The textualist objection says that judges are most in danger of imposing their 
own political preferences on the country when they enforce amorphous ideas of reasonableness without a textual 
peg. 
 
 
 
Conservatives like Justice Scalia have argued powerfully that textualism is important.39 The conservative 
criticisms of Roe,40 for example, and opposition to a judicially discovered right of gay marriage, would be on far 
weaker grounds if social conservatives embrace activism based on unenumerated rights in the economic arena. 
 
 



 
But the problem of Lochner is not only a problem of text. Justice Scalia also criticizes Lochner for its failure to 
defer to the political branches in the face of uncertainty and contestability.41 This was Justice Harlan's point in 
his less rhetorically memorable, but in some ways more legally plausible, dissent.42 Justice Harlan said that 
reasonable people can disagree about whether or not maximum-hour laws are necessary to protect bakers' 
health; judges should defer to legislatures in the face of that uncertainty.43 
 
 
 
Professor Barnett's policy arguments against minimum-wage laws in Lochner and elsewhere are similarly 
plausible. Many conservatives doubt these laws on policy grounds. David Bernstein has just written a book, 
Rehabilitating Lochner, arguing that the minimum-wage laws were ways of favoring unionized workers over their 
nonunionized competitors.44 Justice Harlan's point, however, was that through their legislatures, majorities of 
citizens across the land during the Progressive Era disagreed with that economic analysis, and judges have no 
special competence to enforce contested economic rights in the face of widespread disagreement.45 
 
 
 
Professor Barnett gave a disquisition on the intention of the Framers of the Fourteenth Amendment about 
economic rights, but the history is far more complicated than he suggests.46 It is true that the Framers of the 
Fourteenth Amendment had a suspicion of class legislation, namely legislation that took property away from A 
and gave it to B, and they thought that legislatures could only pass economic regulations that served the public 
interest.47 
 
 
 
But there are two problems with translating or applying this class legislation prohibition in the twenty-first 
century. First, for the Framers, the prohibition on class legislation applied not to all state action but only to a very 
small category of rights; they called these civil rights or privileges and immunities.48 These rights were uniform 
from state to state.49 They were available, not as a matter oí discretion, but one of right50 But they did not 
cover most of the business that the government did. They did not cover welfarestate activities because, of course, 
there was no welfare state.51 Beyond that narrow scope of civil rights, the government was free to discriminate 
against or in favor of people on the basis of race or on the basis of economic favoritism or on any basis it 
pleased.52 
 
 
 
How is it possible to translate this idea of limited absolute equality into a world where the government 
monopolizes highway contracts and provides healthcare? That is a question the Fourteenth Amendment's Framers 
could not have answered because they had no significant welfare state.53 To suggest, as Barnett does, that the 
Framers' narrow notion oí class legislaäon in the libertarian marketplace should be expanded across the entire 
scope of what the federal government does is a historical leap of imagination. It is not justified by what the 
Framers anticipated. 
 
 
 
Professor Barnett also is wrong to suggest that, for the Framers, economic rights were to be enforced by the 
courts rather than Congress. As Professor McConnelI has argued, the most important section of the Fourteenth 
Amendment was Section 5, which authorized Congress to pass the Civil Rights Act.54 The T ramers would have 
been surprised and appalled by the notion that courts had primary responsibility for enforcing these economic 
rights in the face of contrary judgments from Congress.55 
 
 
 
Of course, the third problem with translating the Lochnerian prohibition on class legislation into the post-New 
Deal world is that the very notion of what sort of regulation is in the public interest, which was once uncontested, 
became contested. When Lochner was decided in 1905, judges thought they could agree about what regulations 
were in the public interest and which industries could be regulated as quasi-monopolies.56 They were applying 
formalistic categories. But when the economic reality of the Depression dislodged the idea that intervention on 
behalf of one group of workers would harm society- when indeed intervention on behalf of some came to be seen 
as necessary to avoid a burden on all as the welfare state got up and running- it was no longer possible for 
judges confidently to enforce these nineteenth-century categories. 
 
 
 
To equate these common law categories dating back to the age of Thomas Cooley with the intentions of the 
Framers and ratifiers of the Fourteenth Amendment is too simplistic. And, once consensus about what was in the 
public interest and what was not disappeared, judges appeared to be political when they were enforcing these 
contested categories.57 
 
 



 
That is why Justice Jackson, a pillar of judicial restraint during the New Deal, argued that the Court should get 
out of the business of second-guessing Congress's economic judgments.58 He tried to write an opinion enforcing 
the old categories but found that it would not write. He discovered that he had no special competence to make 
economic judgments about what was reasonable.59 For that reason, he said that judges should get out of the 
business entirely.60 
 
 
 
It is perhaps possible that the Court went too far in advocating judicial abstinence in economic cases. For 
example, the Court in Williamson v. Lee Optical was making up fake reasons for upholding the requirement that 
everyone had to go to an optometrist rather than an optician to get a new prescription.61 Obviously, the real 
reason was to favor optometrists who felt threatened by a new group of economic competitors. The Court 
fabricated the justification that people's eyes would be infected and they might need to get eye exams from a 
professional.62 
 
 
 
So I could imagine a few cases concerning naked rent seeking, clear giveaways from one group of economic 
competitors to another. Total deference might have gone too far. But a strong presumption of deference, rather 
than the presumption of liberty that Professor Barnett advocates in his book Restoring the Lost Constitution^ is 
the only thing that can prevent judges once again from entangling themselves in this contested economic arena. 
 
 
 
The cost of embracing Professor Barnett's vision of economic judicial activism would be high: It would require one 
to embrace judicial activism in areas like personal autonomy and sexual autonomy, from abortion to gay 
marriage.64 Justice Thomas seems most likely to strike down PPACA in the name of a narrow version of the 
Commerce Clause that says that Congress can regulate trade or exchange but not manufacture. 
 
 
 
Based on his constitutional vision, the second most likely Justice to strike down PPACA, though, might well be 
Justice Kennedy. He could strike it down not on the basis of the Commerce Clause but also on the basis of an 
unenumerated right not to be forced to buy what one does not want to buy. This, Charles Fried said in his Senate 
testimony, is really Lochner resurrected.65 The claim that one cannot be forced to buy health insurance or 
broccoli or asparagus or gym memberships, as the Attorney General of Virginia has so memorably argued,66 is 
not an argument about the Commerce Clause or the rights of states. It is an argument that there is a free-
floating right of personal autonomy that states or the federal government cannot infringe and that should prevent 
the government from forcing people to buy anything they do not want to buy. 
 
 
 
That is the same right that Justice Kennedy might embrace in recognizing a right to gay marriage. If "p]iberty 
presumes an autonomy of self/' as Kennedy said in Lawrence ? Texas,67 that autonomy of self might not only 
prevent people from being forced to buy unwanted gym memberships; it might also guarantee their right to 
many the person they love, regardless of his or her gender. It would be hard for Justice Kennedy to use text to 
distinguish the right to contract from the right to autonomy or to say that that free-floating autonomy right at the 
heart of liberty (that Justice Scalia called the "sweet-mystery-of-life" right)68 should apply in the healthcare 
arena but not in the gay marriage arena. Indeed, in one of the healthcare law suits, Phil Bryant, the governor-
elect of Mississippi, challenges the healthcare mandate by invoking both the unenumerated right of freedom of 
contract recognized in Lochner and the unenumerated privacy right recognized in Roe.69 
 
 
 
It is doubtful there are five votes on behalf of striking down healthcare in the name of a Lochnerian right of 
personal autonomy. There is a strong argument that the pro-executive Justices, Chief Justice Roberts and Justice 
Alito, are suspicious of creating unenumerated rights without clear textual limit and that they are too respectful 
of precedent to overturn Wickard v. Filburn70 and to return to a pre-New Deal understanding of the Commerce 
Clause. 
 
 
 
Between 2006 and 2009, the Roberts Court struck down six federal laws.71 The Justice most likely to strike down 
those laws was Justice Kennedy, who voted with the majority in five of the cases.72 Chief Justice Roberts was 
next with four.73 Justices Thomas and Scalia voted to strike down three;74 Justice Alito struck down only two.75 
Justice Alito almost never votes against the federal government in criminal or in statutory cases, and the idea 
that he would lightly strike down an act of Congress on the basis of elusive unenumerated rights seems 
unconvincing. Indeed, I hope that a majority of the conservatives on the Roberts Court will follow the inspiring 
examples of Judges Lawrence Silberman and Jeffrey Sutton, two principled defenders of judicial restraint, both of 
whom voted to uphold the healthcare mandate as part of bipartisan majorities.76 If so. Chief Justice Roberts 



would deserve as much respect for his bipartisan rejection of the libertarian challenges as Judges Silberman and 
Sutton. 
 
 
 
Regardless of what the Court does with healthcare, Federalist Society members should think hard before 
succumbing to the seductive siren calls of Barnett. Many conservatives have policy preferences that coincide with 
his. The Federalist Society, however, teaches that the highest achievement in constitutional interpretation is to 
separate one's policy preferences from one's legal conclusions; to be scrupulous about only second-guessing 
democratic decisions when one's arguments are clearly rooted in text and history and when people on both sides 
of the political spectrum can embrace them. 
 
 
 
Judge Wilkinson, for example, has been a model of this bipartisan tradition of judicial restraint. He has criticized 
the Court's Second Amendment decision in Heller.77 He has criticized Roe ? Wade.78 He has upheld an 
application of the Endangered Species Act in a case attempting to limit the scope of regulations based on it.79 
His policy preferences often diverge from his constitutional conclusions because he recognizes that not only 
economic liberty, but also democratic liberty, is at stake. That liberty permits democratic majorities to debate 
hotly contested policy issues, to reach contrary conclusions, and to settle their disputes, in areas ranging from 
abortion to gay marriage, politically rather than judicially. 
 
 
 
I commend Judge Wilkinson's restrained example to you, and for those who were thinking of straying from his 
traditionally conservative vision of judicial restraint, I look forward to welcoming you back to the fold. 
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