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Dave Brat’s victory over House Majority Leader Eric Cantor has been widely attributed to Bart’s 
opposition to immigration reform. But in his campaign, Brat and his Tea Party backers gave 
equal weight to denouncing Cantor as a tool of Wall Street, the big banks, the U.S. Chamber of 
Commerce and the Business Roundtable. Brat’s campaign reflected an old strain of rightwing 
populism that continues to be an important part of our politics. 

American populism is rooted in middle class resentment of those who are seen as enjoying the 
benefits of the goods and services the middle class produces without having earned them 
through work. Its ideology is what historians call “producerism.” It first appears in the 
Jacksonian Workingmen’s Parties and then in the Populists of the late nineteenth century. But it 
takes a leftwing and a rightwing form. 

Facing an ailing economy, leftwing populists from Huey Long to Paul Wellstone primarily blame 
Wall Street, big business and the politicians whom they fund. Rightwing populists from George 
Wallace to Pat Buchanan also blame Wall Street, but put equal if not greater blame on the poor, 
the unemployed, the immigrant, and the minorities, who, like the coupon-clipper on Wall Street, 
are seen as economic parasites. 

The Tea Party is a heterogeneous movement, but many of its members, and many of the local 
candidates it champions, are rightwing populists. And that was certainly true of Brat. The 
Randolph-Macon College economics professor attacked Cantor for supporting what he called 
“amnesty” for illegal immigrants, but he also took aim at Wall Street and big business. 

Speaking last month before the Mechanicsville Tea Party, Brat tied Cantor to Wall Street and big 
business, whom he blamed partly for the financial crisis. “All the investment banks in the new 
York and DC -- those guys should have gone to jail. Instead of going to jail, they went on Eric’s 
rolodex, and they are sending him big checks,” he said. Brat echoed these charges in a radio 
interview. “The crooks up on Wall Street and some of the big banks -- I’m pro business, I’m just 
talking about the crooks -- they didn’t go to jail they are on Eric’s rolodex,” he said. 

Brat and local Tea Party leaders also criticized Cantor for attempting to water down the Stock 
Act, which banned members of Congress from profiting from insider trading. “One congressman 
changed the act so spouses could benefit from insider trading,” Brat charged, referring to 
Cantor. (Cantor drew equal fire from Democrats for attempting to undermine the bill.) 
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Brat’s case against immigration reform was directed at big business as much as it was directed at 
the immigrants themselves. “They get cheap labor,” he said of big business, “but everyone in the 
7th district gets cheap wages.” He accused Cantor of following business’s lead on immigration 
reform. “Eric is running on the Chamber of Commerce and Business Roundtable principles,” 
Brat told a Tea Party audience. “They want amnesty for illegal immigrants. They want them 
granted citizenship. And it’s in the millions -- 40 millions coming in. if you add 40 million 
workers to our labor supply, what will happen to the wage rate for the average American?” 

Brat’s appeal was frankly demagogic. Cantor was not supporting amnesty, and there are about 
10 million illegal immigrants currently in the United States. Some of Brat’s Tea Party supporters 
took it a step further. Larry Nordvig, the head of the Richmond Tea Party, told a joke at Brat 
rally. “A politician, a Muslim, and an illegal alien walk into a bar, and you now what the 
bartender said? Good evening, Mr. President.” 

If he is elected in November, Brat may, of course, jettison the anti-Wall Street and anti-big 
business side of his politics. His actual economic views appear to be close to those of the Cato 
Institute and Ayn Rand. His solutions for America’s flagging economy consist in flattening the 
tax code and cutting spending – positions that will certainly not alienate the Chamber of 
Commerce or Business Roundtable. But in defeating Cantor, Brat echoed the age-old, darker, 
and more complicated themes of right-wing populism. These themes will continue to resonate, 
even if Brat abandons them. 
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